
012FOI2223 – Wheelchair services 
 
Request / Response 
 
The information below relates to our Leeds area: 
 

1. Who is the current provider of wheelchair services (WCS)? 
 
Leeds Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust (LTHT) – service specification – 
Wheelchair and Posture Services for children, young people and adults 
(standard and specialised) 
 

2. What is the total value of the WCS contract? 
 
The services are part of the LTHT total contract, we are able to confirm we 
paid the following in 2021/22: 
Adults & Paediatric = £2,177,660 
 

3. What is the duration of the WCS contract? 
 
It is an annual NHS Trust Contract – 1 year 
 

4. What is the end date of the WCS contract? When would the new tender be 
released? 
 
31st March 2023 

 
5. Who is the current provider of approved repair services (AR)? (if different from 

WCS) 
 
We do not hold this information, this will be available from LTHT* 
 

6. What is the total value of the AR contract? 
 
We do not hold this information, this will be available from LTHT* 
 

7. What is the duration of the AR contract? 
 
We do not hold this information, this will be available from LTHT* 
 

8. What is the end date of the AR contract? When would the new tender be 
released? 
 
We do not hold this information, this will be available from LTHT* 
 

9. Were these contracts (WCS and AR) direct awards or tenders? Was there an 
option for direct award and what framework was accessed? 
 
These services have always been contracted through LTHT NHS Standard 
Contract 



 
10. Is specialist seating provision included in the WCS provision? If not, who is 

the provider, and what are the contract value, duration, end date and new 
tender release date? 
 
Yes 

 
11. Is Children’s and adult’s wheelchair provision/ maintenance within the same 

contract? If not could you please provide the requested metrics for each? 
 
Yes they are both delivered by same provider. We specify the national 
wheelchair data collection metrics. NHS England » Wheelchair services: 
National Wheelchair Data Collection Guidance 

 
12. What is the number of patients served? (Current number and contractual 

target) 
 
5989 adults and 667 children registered with the service as @ Q1 2022/23 

 
13. What share of the current WCS-AR expenditure currently spent by NHS 

facilities (i.e. insourced) will be tendered to outsourced providers in the next 
contractual cycle? 
 
We do not hold this information, this will be available from LTHT* 
 

* Leeds Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust 
Email:  Leedsth-tr.informationgovernance@nhs.net. 

 
 
The information below relates to our Kirklees and Calderdale area who have a joint 
service: 
 

1. Who is the current provider of wheelchair services (WCS)? 
 
Ross Care Auto Engineering Limited. 
 
2. What is the total value of the WCS contract? 
 
The annual value of the Posture and Mobility service is £1,624,637. 
 
3. What is the duration of the WCS contract? 
 
The contract commenced 1 October 2019 for a period of 5 years (there is also an 
option to extend by a further 2 years). 
 
4. What is the end date of the WCS contract? When would the new tender be 

released? 
 
The expiry date of the original contract term is 30 September 2024. However, 
there is an option to extend by a further 2 years. 
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5. Who is the current provider of approved repair services (AR)? (if different from 

WCS) 
 
Ross Care is also the provider of the approved repair service. 
 
6. What is the total value of the AR contract? 
 
This service is managed on a block contract basis which includes the provision of 
equipment and the approved repair service. 
 
7. What is the duration of the AR contract? 
 
Please refer to the answer given to question 3. 
 
8. What is the end date of the AR contract? When would the new tender be 

released? 
 
Please refer to the answer given to question 4. 
 
9. Were these contracts (WCS and AR) direct awards or tenders? Was there an 

option for direct award and what framework was accessed? 
 
A full tender procurement process was undertaken. 
 
10. Is specialist seating provision included in the WCS provision? If not, who is 

the provider, and what are the contract value, duration, end date and new 
tender release date? 

 
Yes, specialist seating provision is included in the Posture and Mobility contract. 
 
11. Is Children’s and adult’s wheelchair provision/ maintenance within the same 

contract? If not could you please provide the requested metrics for each? 
 
The Posture and Mobility contract covers both adults and children. 
 
12. What is the number of patients served? (Current number and contractual 

target) 
 
As of May 2022, there are 9595 registered adult service users and 1032 
registered paediatric service users.   
 
13. What share of the current WCS-AR expenditure currently spent by NHS 

facilities (i.e. insourced) will be tendered to outsourced providers in the next 
contractual cycle? 

 
The WYICB does not hold this information and is not currently considering a 
procurement process for this service due to the expiry date of the original 
contract term being September 2024. 

 



 
In Bradford, the requested information is not held, it has an integrated commissioned 
service as part of a block contract from Bradford District Care NHS Foundation Trust 
Please contact Bradford District Care NHS Foundation Trust 
Email: foi.requests@bdct.nhs 
 
The providers are ; 
Airedale NHS Foundation Trust 
Email: foi@anhst.nhs.uk 
 
Bradford Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
Email: foi@bthft.nhs.uk 
 
 
In Wakefield, wheelchair services are provided by Wakefield Council and as such 
they will hold the information all the contracting information.  
Wakefield Council can be contacted at freedomofinformation@wakefield.gov.uk. 
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